
Processional:                Jesus in the Morning  

S t .  P a t r i c k  C a t h o l i c  C h u r c h  

The Mission of St. Patrick Catholic Community is to proclaim and live the Gospel message of unconditional love, healing and 
reconciliation through prayer, celebration and action on behalf of justice as a sign of hope for all God's people. 

27th Sunday in Ordinary Time  

10/2/2022 



“O Lord, how long shall I cry for help, and you will not listen? Or cry to you ‘Violence! And 
you will not save? Why do you make me see wrongdoing and look at trouble? Destruction and 
violence are before me; strife and contention arise." Then the Lord answered me and said: 
“Write the vision; make it plain on tablets, so that a runner may read it. For there is still a 
vision for the appointed time; it speaks of the end, and does not lie. If it seems to tarry, wait for 
it; it will surely come, it will not delay. Look at the proud person! Their spirit is not right in 
them, but the righteous person lives by their faith.” 

The word of the Lord.      R/: Thanks be to God. 

First Reading:    Habakkuk 1.2-3; 2.2-4  

Gloria: 

Glory to God in the highest, and on earth peace to people of good will. We praise you, we 
bless you, we adore you, we glorify you, we give you thanks for your great glory, Lord God, 

heavenly King, O God, almighty Father. Lord Jesus Christ, Only Begotten Son, Lord God, 
Lamb of God, Son of the Father, you take away the sins of the world, have mercy on us; you 

take away the sins of the world, receive our prayer; you are seated at the right hand of the 
Father,  have mercy on us. For you alone are the Holy One, you alone are the Lord, you alone 
are the Most High, Jesus Christ, with the Holy Spirit, in the glory of God the Father. Amen.  

Responsorial:    Psalm 95  

Second Reading:  2 Timothy 1.6-8, 13-14  

Beloved: I remind you to rekindle the gift of God that is within you through the laying on of 
my hands; for God did not give us a spirit of cowardice, but rather a spirit of power and of love 
and of self-discipline. Do not be ashamed, then, of the testimony about our Lord or of me his 
prisoner, but join with me in suffering for the Gospel, relying on the power of God. Hold to the 
standard of sound teaching that you have heard from me, in the faith and love that are in Christ 
Jesus. Guard the good treasure entrusted to you, with the help of the Holy Spirit living in us.  

The word of the Lord.             R/: Thanks be to God. 



Gospel:   Luke 17.5-10  

The Apostles said to the Lord, “Increase our faith!” The Lord replied, “If you had faith the size 
of a mustard seed, you could say to this mulberry tree, ‘Be uprooted and planted in the sea,’ 
and it would obey you. “Who among you would say to your slave who has just come in from 
ploughing or tending sheep in the field, ‘Come here at once and take your place at the table’? 
Would you not rather say to him, ‘Prepare supper for me, put on your apron and serve me 
while I eat and drink; later you may eat and drink’? Do you thank the slave for doing what was 
commanded? So you also, when you have done all that you were ordered to do, say, ‘We are 
worthless slaves; we have done only what we ought to have done!’”  

The Gospel of the Lord.    R/:  Praise to you Lord Jesus Christ 

Profession of Faith:  

I believe in one God, the Father, the Almighty, Maker of heaven and earth, of all things visible 

and invisible.  I believe in one Lord Jesus Christ, the only-begotten Son of God, born of the 

Father before all ages, God from God, Light from Light, true God from true God, begotten, not 

made, consubstantial with the Father.  Through him all things were made.  For us and for our 

salvation he came down from heaven: by the power of the Holy Spirit was incarnate of the 

Virgin Mary, and became man.  For our sake he was crucified under Pontius Pilate; he suffered 

death and was buried, and rose again on the third day in accordance with the Scriptures.  He 

ascended into heaven and is seated at the right hand of the Father.  He will come again in glory 

to judge the living and the dead, and his kingdom will have no end.  I believe in the Holy 

Spirit, the Lord, the giver of life, who proceeds from the Father and the Son.  With the Father 

and the Son he is adored and glorified.  He has spoken through the Prophets.  I believe in one, 

holy, catholic and apostolic Church.  I confess one baptism for the forgiveness of sins, and I 

look forward to the resurrection of the dead, and the life of the world to come.   

R/:  Amen. 



Presentation of Gifts:      We Walk by Faith 



Communion:   We are Many Parts 



Recessional:      What a Friend We Have in Jesus 



Music/lyrics reprinted with permission.  OneLicense.net #A-727781. 

Prayer of St. Patrick 

Spirit of life, Spirit of wisdom, be active among us, the people of St. Patrick 

Community.  Bring us together and keep us together in unity of mind and 

heart as we search for ways to live the Gospel in our present and in our 

future.  Lead us and inspire us in fulfilling our mission as disciples of Jesus in 

this community of believers, now and always. 

Amen. 


